HARYANA GOVERNMENT
EXCISE AND TAXATION DEPARTMENT
Notification
The 4™ February, 2004

No. S.0.15/H.A. 6/2003/S. 60/2004. — In exercise of the powers
conferred by sub-section (1) of section 60 of the Haryana Value Added Tax Act,
2003 (Act 6 of 2003), and all other powers enabling him in this behalf, and with
reference to Haryana Government, Excise and Taxation Department, notification
No. web 14/H.A. 6/2003/S.60/2004, dated the 23 January, 2004, the Governor
of Haryana hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Haryana
Value Added Tax Rules, 2003, namely: -

1. These rules may be called the Haryana Value Added Tax
(Amendment) Rules, 2004.

2. In the Haryana Value Added Tax Rules, 2003 (hereinafter called the

said rules), the existing rule 10 shall be renumbered as sub-rule (1)

thereof and after sub-rule (1) so renumbered, the following sub-rule shall

be added with effect from 15" February, 2004, namely:-

“(2) In relation to a dealer in whose case taxable quantum as
specified in sub-section (2) of section 3 of the Act or in the
foregoing sub-rule is not nil, the taxable quantum shall be
five lakh rupees and he shall be liable to pay tax on and from

the day following the day his gross turnover in any year first

exceeds the taxable quantum.”.

3. Inthe said rules, in rule 52,-
M in sub-rule (2)-
0] for the words “twenty five lakh rupees”, the words
“forty lakh rupees” shall be substituted ;
(i) under heading “Application in form A”, for the existing
para, the following para shall be substituted, namely:-
“MWe. .o, proprietor/partner/director/manager of
M/s ........... district.......... holding TIN......... opt for payment of

lump sum in lieu of tax from the month following the month in



which my application for lump sum payment is allowed in terms of
the provisions of rule 46 and 52 of the Haryana Value Added Tax
Rules, 2003.”;
(1) in sub-rule (7), for the words “ twenty five lakh rupees”, the
words “forty lakh rupees” shall be substituted.
CHANDER SINGH

Financial Commissioner and Principal Secretary
to Government Haryana, Excise and Taxation Department.



RATON IRBR
JMEHRT TAT BRI 9T

SIERCE]

fQHId 4 HRANT, 2004
HTT HI0RM0 15/ BOII0 6 / 2003/ €10 60/ 2004 — ERATON He afefd &
rfarfd, 2003 (2003 BT RAFTH 6), BT TRT 60 B IYART (1) FRT UG Bl T
eIfdl dor 59 e S8 Wl 991 arell 941 3= fdeial &1 YA HRd 8T, a1
ERATN TRGR, MFHRN qA BRI AW, IfEAGT=T H@T H10370 9 14 /B0310
6,/2003 /8110 60 /2004, f&=TdH 23 STHaxI, 2004, & Ufa e & sRAoT & ISvdTd,
SIS gI]T, BRI Hog affd & 199, 2003, BT 3 NI &= & forg fr=afaRaa
BPEEEIREACOIGES

1. A fam eRaron Hog aftfa o (Fene) e, 2004, B ST AH B |

2. BRAN e aftfd e ¥, 2003 (5778, 594, 39 91, Sad 199 &8l 71 8)
¥, faerd = 10 31, S9@ Iu—14 (1) & S H 4 GATihd AT SIQen a1 54
YR Y: HeTfhd SU—F1| (1) & 918, YorH BRaR], 2004, ¥ Fr=forRad Iu—fre
Sire & S, srerid—

"(2) Tl gl & WY H TS AT H MR B RT3 31
IU—4RT (2) 9 I1 gaadi SY—gH 4 fafafdse Hda /3 3= 718
g HRI9YT AT Ul g wUY 811 d1 98, 9 a7 & ol faT |
T forsdt a9 # SFHT Aot JMTad YUH: BRI AT | 7SS &8l
ST &, B & I BT ST BT |

3. Iad i |, e 52 95—

1  Su-fEEE)E,
() o= o ®UY” TG @ M W, ITeiN o ®UY” I7eq
gforenfud fed S ;
(i) UwUH H e MY B A fIeme R & < W,
fereferRad U afcreenfoa faan S, srerfe —

“H/gH A @ @
/eRErR/ffeed,/ uewd, e at
TS, T gTRd gRATN Jeu aftfa & s,

2003, @ 19 46 T2H1 52 & U & el & JFTAR 74
A W AR 3MTdE Ueb G2 R & YA & foTg S=ir faba
STl & S99 3Tl A1 A PR DI Ydb 93 MR & YA Bl
P Tm /a2 I;




(1) SI—f9 (7) H, "oedN <IRg HUY” Ia] & I IR ¢ Aol g wuy”
vreg yforenfud fbu S |

= g
facaTgerd Ud 9T Aferd, gRITON ARG,
MBI TAT BRI AU




